
DHANUS (Sagittarius) 
Moola, Poorvashada, Uttarashada(1) 

Career: Cosmos will lend its supersized support to Entrepreneurs to topple and 
soar above their rivals. At workplace, expect an offer of a leadership role or 
salary-hike to come gliding your way. Efforts of marketing professionals will 
fetch surplus benefits in coming weeks. Professionals will receive recognition 
and “expert status” with a commensurate title. Strong networking will become 
a great resource for job seekers to bag in a stable job. After 14th, tactless 
remarks will end up in power struggles with colleagues or seniors. Higher 
Management will face the pressure of tight deadlines and heavy workload. 
Artists will need to sharpen their skills to cash in creative opportunities. Think 
carefully, before you sign on the dotted line on a tempting collaboration. 
Unforeseen obstacles might arise, when launching a new service or product.   

Wealth: Profits from previous investments will help settle lingering debts. 
Capitalizing in shares and bonds will pivot you towards rich yields. Avoid 
getting into speculations or quick rich schemes. After 14th, keep a firm grip on 
your wallet as expenses will double up. Avoid being impulsive in closing the 
deal to any real estate investments. Re-payment of forgotten debts will bring 
in extra added cashflow into the coffers. This month, make loan agreements on 
crystal clear terms to avoid regrets later. 

Personal:  Feel those feelings! Students with dedication at their side will 
achieve considerable success in examinations. For women, inspiring old 
acquaintances will be back into their sphere. Displaying strong reactions will 
upset the stable balance of a relationship for couples. Relations will get 
strained with mother. After 14th, be direct without coming across as 
confrontational, to avoid conflicts with loved ones. Singles will feel especially 
frustrated with lack of worthy love prospects around them. This month, make 
sure that anything you book, when making travel plans, is fully refundable.  

Health: Healthy living is the name of your game! This month, re-evaluating 
your exercise and eating habits will help stabilize energy levels. Those suffering 
from chronic ailments related to stomach, eyes and chest will need to be extra 
careful. Continuing the intake of healthy produce will keep seasonal flues in 
check.    



Moola:  You will be feeling, moody, and may go out and take a break from all 
responsibilities. 

Poorvashada:  Time will bring a new slant to what seemed like an impossible 
situation.  

Uttarashada(1):  You will be subjected to erratic eating or sleeping habits. If 
you feel ill, you will soon recover. 

Vedic Remedies: Recite Daridra Dahan Stothra 6 times daily in the morning. 
Offer White Lotus to Goddess Mahalakshmi on Fridays. Donate medicines to 
the needy people. Worship Lord Venkateshwara Swami everday. Visit His 
temple often. 

Lal-Kitab Remedies: Wear a Silver chain around the neck Keep the roof-top of 
your house neat, clean and dry 

Cautious Dates:  09, 10, 11. 


